
“”Empowering global talent while bridging the
gap between education and employment.

Diana Trixia Erese
Operations Manager
Diane holds both a Master of Business Administration (MBA)
degree and a Bachelor of Science in Business Administration
degree from the Pamantasan ng Lungsod ng Maynila
(University of the City of Manila), a city government-funded,
chartered, and autonomous institution. These have provided
her with a strong understanding of business principles and
practices. 

As Operations Manager at Kidney Australia, Diane has
demonstrated exemplary leadership and management
expertise, spearheading operational excellence across all
levels. She has successfully led and developed high-
performing teams through effective recruitment, training,
and supervision. Additionally, she has provided instrumental
support in financial management, strategic planning,
auditing, and reporting, thereby enabling informed decision-
making at the directorial level.

Diane’s 11 years of banking experience have proven to be a
significant asset in her current role, as she has been able to
leverage her expertise in training and developing manpower,
detecting fraudulent documents, and verifying applicant
authenticity, as well as reconciling financial records and
ensuring accounting accuracy. 

As Past President of the Kiwanis Club of Intercity Next
Generation, a chapter of Kiwanis International, Diane
demonstrated her ability to lead and work with diverse
groups. She has also been an active member of the Sacred
Heart of Jesus Parish Lectors and Commentators Group,
honing her public speaking and communication skills.
Through these roles, she has developed a unique ability to
effectively communicate and engage with diverse audiences,
demonstrating skills beyond her PTE score of 82. 


